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Project swapan Kumar Majhi SERB-Notification
1 message

Dr. Tarun Kumar Barik <tarun.barik2003@gmail.com> Thu, Apr 4, 2024 at 3:48 PM
To: amcollegenaac@gmail.com

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Swapan Majhi <majhi.majhi@gmail.com>
Date: Thu, Nov 17, 2022, 13:32

Subject: Fwd: SERB-Notification

To: Tarun Barik <tarun.barik2003@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: Swapan Majhi <majhi.majhi@gmail.com>

Date: Mon, Apr 1, 2019, 11:02

Subject: Fwd: SERB-Notification

To: V RAVINDRAN <ravindra@imsc.res.in>, V RAVINDRAN <vravi.imsc@gmail.com>

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: <SERB_Administrator@serbonline.in>
Date: Fri, Mar 29, 2019 at 11:45 AM

Subject: SERB-Notification

To: <"info@serbonline.in"@imsva02.cdacnoida.in>

o

(‘_ SERB Science and Engineering Research Board
! DIA (Statutory Body Established Through an Act of Parliament : SERB Act 2008)
Department of Science and Technology, Government of India

FILE NO. TAR/2018/000216
SCIENCE & ENGINEERING RESEARCH BOARD(SERB)
(A statutory body of the Department of Science & Technology, government of India)

5 & 5A, Lower Ground Floor
Vasant Square Mall

Plot No. A, Community Centre
Sector-B, Pocket-5, Vasant Kunj
New Delhi-110070

Dated: 22-Mar-2019
ORDER

Subject: Financial Sanction under Teachers Associateship for Research Excellence (TARE) to Dr. Swapan
Kumar Majhi, ACHHRURAM MEMORIAL COLLEGE , Jhalda, District: Purulia, West Bengal, India,
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Purulia, West Bengal-723202- under the mentorship of V Ravindran, at Institute of Mathematical
Sciences IV Cross Road, CIT Campus Taramani, Chennai - 600113- Release of 1st grant.

Sanction of Science and Engineering Research Board (SERB) is hereby accorded to the above mentioned
grant at a total cost of Rs. 18,30,000/- (Rs. Eighteen Lakh Thirty Thousand Only) for a duration of 36 months.

The date of start of the project will be 04 December, 2018 .The items of expenditure for which the total
allocation of Rs. 18,30,000/- has been approved are given below:

The following budget is proposed for

ACHHRURAM MEMORIAL COLLEGE , Jhalda, District: Purulia, West Bengal, India,
Purulia, West Bengal-723202 (Parent)

|SI. No. \Budget Head |Amount

1. Fellowship Rs. 0 (@0/- per month (consolidated))
|2. \Research Grant |Rs. 2,50,000/- per annum
|3. \Overheads |Rs. 25,000/- per annum

Institute of Mathematical Sciences IV Cross Road, CIT Campus Taramani, Chennai -
600113 (Host)

SI.
No. Budget Head ||Amount
1 Fellowship Rs. 60,000 ( on completion of 90 days mandatory attendance in the host institute every
year)
2. Research Rs. 2,50,000/- per annum
Grant
|3. \Overheads |Rs. 25,000/- per annum

2. Sanction of the SERB is also accorded to the payment of Rs. 2,75,000/- (Rupees Two Lakh Seventy Five
Thousand only) to ACHHRURAM MEMORIAL COLLEGE, JHALDA, DISTRICT: PURULIA, WEST BENGAL,
INDIA , Rs. 3,35,000/- (Rupees Three Lakh Thirty Five Thousand only) to Institute of Mathematical Sciences
IV Cross Road, CIT Campus Taramani, Chennai - 600113 being the first installment of the grant for the year
2018-2019 for implementation of the said research project.

3. The expenditure involved is debitable to
Fund for Science & Engineering Research (FSER)

This release is being made under Teachers Associateship For Research Excellence (TARE). (Plasma High
Energy Nuclear Physics Astronomy & Astrophysics and Nonlinear dynamics)

4. The Sanction has been issued to with the approval of the competent authority vide Diary No. SERB/F/
12545/2018-2019 dated 20 March, 2019
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5. Sanction of the grant is subject to the conditions as detailed in Terms & Conditions available at website
( www.serb.gov.in).

6. Overhead expenses are meant for the host Institute towards the cost for providing infrastructural facilities and
general administrative support etc. including benefits to the staff employed in the project.

7. As per rule 211 of GFR, the accounts of project shall be open to inspection by sanctioning authority/audit
whenever the institute is called upon to do so.

8. The release amount of Rs. 2,75,000/- (Rupees Two Lakh Seventy Five Thousand only) will be drawn by the
Under Secretary of the SERB and will be disbursed by means of RTGS transaction as per their Bank details given
below:

ACHHRURAM MEMORIAL COLLEGE
Account Name

11693738015
Account Number

Bank Name & Branch STATE BANK OF INDIA JHALDA KUIRYPARA PO- JHALDA PURULIA WEST
BENGAL - 723202

IFSC/RTGS Code SBIN0007101
Email address of Pl majhi.majhi@gmail.com
Email id of A/C Holder ticprincipalamc@gmail.com

Email address of concerned ms_tare@serbonline.in
officer

The release amount of Rs. 3,35,000/- (Rupees Three Lakh Thirty Five Thousand only) will be drawn by the Under
Secretary of the SERB and will be disbursed by means of RTGS transaction as per their Bank details given
below:

THE INSTITUTE OF MATHEMATICAL SCIENCES-PROJECTS
Account Name

801020110000302
Account Number

Bank Name & Branch BANK OF INDIA BRANCH ADYAR NO. 33/3 1ST MAIN ROAD GANDHI NAGAR
ADYAR CHENNAI - 600020

IFSC/RTGS Code BKID0008010
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Email address of Pl majhi.majhi@gmail.com
Email id of A/C Holder registrar@imsc.res.in
Email address of ms_tare@serbonline.in
concerned officer

9.Both the institutes will furnish Utilization certificate(UCs) financial year wise to the SERB and an audited
statement of accounts pertaining to the grant immediately after the end of each financial year.

10. The institute will maintain separate audited accounts for the fellowship. A part or whole of the grant must be
kept in an interest earning bank account which is to be reported to SERB. The interest thus earned will be treated
as credit to the institute to be adjusted towards further installment of the grant.

11. The File no. TAR/2018/000216 may also be mentioned in all research communications arising from the above
project with due acknowledgement of SERB.

12. As this is the first grant for the fellowship, no previous U/C is required.

13. The institute may refund any unspent balance to SERB by means of a Demand Draft favoring "FUND FOR
SCIENCE AND ENGINEERING RESEARCH" payable at New Delhi.

14. The organization/institute/university should ensure that the technical support/financial assistance provided to
them by the Science & Engineering Research Board, a statutory body of the Department of Science & Technology
(DST), Government of India should invariably be highlighted/ acknowledged in their media releases as well as in
bold letters in the opening paragraphs of their Annual Report.

15. In addition, the investigator/host institute must also acknowledge the support provided to them in all
publications, patents and any other output emanating out of the project/program funded by the Science &
Engineering Research Board, a statutory body of Department of Science & Technology (DST), Government of

India.
(Dr. T Thangaradjou)
Scientist E
ms_tare@serbonline.in
To,

Under Secretary
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SERB, New Delhi

Copy forwarded for information and necessary action to: -

1. The Principal Director of Audit, A.G.C.R.Building, llird Floor I.P. Estate, Delhi-110002
2. Sanction Folder, SERB , New Delhi.
3. File Copy
4. (i) Dr. Swapan Kumar Majhi
Physics

ACHHRURAM MEMORIAL COLLEGE , Jhalda, district: purulia, west bengal, india, Purulia,
West bengal-723202

Email: majhi.majhi@gmail.com

Mobile: 917003475183

(ii) V Ravindran

Institute of Mathematical Sciences IV Cross Road, CIT Campus Taramani, Chennai - 600113

(Start date of the project may be intimated by name to the undersigned. For guidance,
terms & Conditions etc. Please visit www.serb.gov.in.)

5. (i) PRINCIPAL,
ACHHRURAM MEMORIAL COLLEGE, JHALDA, DISTRICT: PURULIA, WEST BENGAL,
INDIA

(ii)DIRECTOR

Institute of Mathematical Sciences IV Cross Road, CIT Campus Taramani, Chennai - 600113

(Receipt of Grant may be intimated by name to the undersigned)

(Dr. T Thangaradjou)
Scientist E

ms_tare@serbonline.in

LEGAL DISCLAIMER

Please do not reply to this mail !!
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[ SERB is now on Social-Media. Kindly follow us on Twitter: @serbonline https://www.twitter.com/serbonline]

This is a system generated information and does not require any signature.This E-Mail may contain Confidential and/
or legally privileged Information and is meant for the intendedrecipient(s) only. If you have received this e-mail in error
and are not the intended recipient/s, kindly notify us at info@serbonline.in and then delete this e-mail immediately
from your system. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure, dissemination, forwarding, printing or copying of this
email or any action taken in reliance on this e-mail is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. Internet communications
cannot be guaranteed to be timely,secure, error or virus-free. The sender does not accept any liability for any errors,
omissions, viruses or computer problems experienced by any recipient as a result of this e-mail.
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'SAVE PAPER - THINK BEFORE YOU PRINT!'

* Don’t want to receive such notification anymore?Click here to send a mail to unsubscribe

Swapan Kumar Majhi
Assistant Professor

Dept. of Physics,

Achhruram Memorial College
Jhalda, Purulia-723202
Phone: +917003475183
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METALEPTEA

1992, Campinas, Brazil — Studying nymphs of
the Mato Grosso locust with Ivo Pierozzi Jr.,
a Brazilian colleague from Embrapa. (photo
credit: Michel Lecoq)

native village was about a kilometer
away, and everywhere around was the
grassy, flat, and empty expanses of
the Horombe Plateau. Having arrived
at the end of the dry season, I barely
had time to create a firewall around

my camp, before a bushfire would
burn all the surrounding vegetation.
I managed to save the camp...and my
thesis work! I suppose that the pur-
pose of such a site was also to test the
resilience to field work, in somewhat
spartan conditions, of a young student
fresh out of Paris University and who
had no preparations for work in the
bush. I passed the test successfully
and my tropical career was launched!
These are of course only two an-
ecdotes. | was fortunate to be able to
get excited about many other issues
around the world. Unfortunately, all
this work was inevitably strewn with
moments of anguish and emotion:
the attack of my camp by brigands in
the Sahara in 1991 where a colleague
was unfortunately killed, a helicopter
crash the same year also in the Sahara
in the middle of nowhere, a peasant
revolt in Madagascar in 1971 and the
attack on the small town of Betioky,
headquarters of the national center for
locust control...but also intense mo-
ments, such as a dinner with the emir
of Kanem in Chad on the terrace of
his palace, a meeting with the Presi-
dent of Senegal on the occasion of the

Desert locust invasion in 2005, the
discovery of a dinosaur skeleton in
the Saharan Tamesna, a head-to-head
encounter with a deer and the discov-
ery of recent traces of the passage of a
panther while I was alone in the heart
of the Brazilian Cerrado. Many mo-
ments of emotion where I happened
to recall my reading as a youth the
“Strange Safari” by Margaret Ruthin,
or “The Mighty Orinoco” by Jules
Verne. The enthusiasm of youth is a
driving force to be cultivated through-
out one’s life. That’s all that I wish
my younger colleagues.

I will not finish this brief article
of memories without thanking the
Orthopterists’ Society for the confi-
dence it has given me over the years
in various positions of responsibility,
for the wealth of scientific exchanges,
for friendship developed with many
colleagues, for the good times spent
together in all corners of the world.
Our society is a source of richness in
the scientific world. Let’s continue to
live life and support our Society with
dedication, enthusiasm, pleasure, and
love.

The 2019 Theodore J. Cohn Research

ear fellow Orthopterists,

From the many research

proposals submitted this

year to the Theodore J.

Cohn Research Fund
Committee, 11 projects have been
selected for a total of $14,309 USD.
Below is the list of the successful
candidates (by alphabetical order of
surname) and the title of their re-
search project:

e Nicole Abate(U.S.A.) - Behavioral
response to multi-channel environ-
mental noise: tracking noise-induced

Grants Funded

By MICHEL LECOQ

Chair, Theodore J. Cohn Research Fund Committee

changes in daily activity patterns and
mate attraction strategies in Acheta
domesticus.

e Lara-Sophie Day (Germany) - Inte-
grative taxonomical revision of the
tribe Bryodemini Bey-Bienko, 1930.

e Arijit Ganguly (India) - Can kapton
tape covering minimise the adverse
effects of LED light on the behav-
ioural pattern and life history of
flower visiting Indian grasshoppers?

e  Abigail Hayes (U.S.A.) - Morph
formation, environmental cues, and
transduction mechanisms underpin-
ning development in the wing dimor-
phic sand cricket, Gryllus firmus.

e Douglas Lawton (U.S.A.) - How does

mlecoq34@gmail.com

landscape structure degradation
impact locust population dynamics?

e Ulises Lopez-Mora (Mexico) - Egg
morphology among the genus Pseu-
dosermyle Caudell, 1903 (Insecta:
Phasmatodea).

e Aileen Van der Mescht (South
Africa) - Acoustic response of a
threatened katydid species (Tetti-
goniidae: Thoracistus thyraeus) to a
fragmented landscape mosaic.

e lan Rines (U.S.A.) - Accessory-gland
proteins as purveyors of reproduc-
tive manipulation: using RNAi to
explore sexual conflict in decorated
crickets.

e Madan Subedi (Nepal) - Altitudinal

Volume 39 (2) / May 2019
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THE ORTHOPTERISTS SOCIETY

Montpellier, France, February 6, 2021

| the undersigned Michel Lecoq, Manager of The Theodore J. Cohn Research Fund,
past-President of the Orthopterists ’Society, certifies that Dr. Ganguly Arijit,
Assistant Professor of Zoology, Achhruram Memorial College, Jhalda, Purulia, India
received, in 2019, a “Theodore J. Cohn Research Grant” of USD 1328 from the
Orthopterists' Society for his research project entitled "Can kapton tape covering
minimize the adverse effects of LED light on the behavioral pattern and life history of
flower visiting Indian grasshoppers?”

After successful completion of his work, in 2020, Dr. Ganguly Arijit published a report
on this subject in the journal Metaleptea of our Society:

Ganguly A. Can kapton screening minimize the adverse effects of LED light on
the behavioral pattern and life history of flower visiting Indian grasshoppers?
Metaleptea 2020, 40 (3), 10-12.

This certificate is issued to serve the purpose it might be required.

A

Michel Lecoq

Entomologist

Past President, Orthopterists' Society: http://orthsoc.org/

Manager, The Ted Cohn Research Fund

Subject Editor, Journal of Orthoptera Research: https://jor.pensoft.net
Web: http://mlecog34.wix.com/michellecoq

ORCID: 0000-0003-4515-3505


http://orthsoc.org/
https://jor.pensoft.net/
http://mlecoq34.wix.com/michellecoq
https://orcid.org/0000-0003-4515-3505

Office of the Purulia Zilla Parishad

Iuhilee Compound, Purulla: 725101
Ph.; 03252-226577; £ Mall: asorp. pd@gmall. com

Meme No. 4RB/DE/PZP of 2021 Date.  ¥0.30.2021

To 15", FC Tied

MIS Shubhankar Kumar,
Durgu,Chekya, Kotshilla
Purulia (P002623481)

Construction of Tollet  Block at AM College,thalda

Subi- Work Order for
Ref :
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Jhalda P, West Bengal, India
9X9Q+7WX, Jhalda P, Bargram, West Bengal 723202, India
Lat 23.36823°

Long 85.989586°
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Achhruram Memorial College

[AFFILIATED 1O SIDHO<KANHO-BIRSHA UNIVERSITY
JHALDA, PURULIA, WEST BENGAL, INDIA, PIN: 723 202

el Bl TTLD 185 "/o"i Date: 0. 74
Ref _\r”‘.l_("!l! &_."f 4(’} d ’
0
Mprs. Nivedita Mahato
Sabhadhipati
Porulia Zilla Parishad
Purulia

Subject: Request for Issuing the Duplicate Copy for the Sanctioned Order of
Construction Work of Toilet Block at Achhruram Memorial College, Jhalda

Respected Madam,

The construction of Toilet-Block was executed for Achhruram Memorial College, Jhalda fron
Zilla Parishad, Purulia in the year 2021. The details of the constructed Toilet Block are as

follows: :
Source of Fund: 15" FC Tied
Date of Starting: 10/11/2021

Date of Completion: 11/04/2022
Awarded Cost: 12.572 Lakh

Therefore, I humbly request you to issue,a duplicate certificate for the constructedyoilet block
by mentioning the Fund allocated in favor of Achhruram Memorial College, Jhalda

Please do the needful at the earliest.

Thanking You q}J\

4%

Principal
Achhruram Memorial College

Jhalda, Purulia

Mohile No: 7001631211

Emall: ticprincipala



Achhruram Memorial Collene

[AFFILIATED To SIDHO-KANHO-BIRSHA UNIVERSITY]
JHALDA, PURULIA, WEST BENGAL, INDIA; PIN: 7_23 202

Ref No: ﬂugr]qsftn.b] r357 ] e s eI

To

Mrs. Nivedita Mahato

Sabhadhipati :

Purulia Zilla Parishad
= Purulia

Subject: Request for Issuing the Duplicate Copy for the Sanctioned Order of Sinking of Deep
Tube Well with Solar Pump & Pipe Line at Achhruram Memorial College, Jhalda
(under Drinking Water Supply Schemes)

Respected Madam.

The sinking of Deep Tube.Well with Solar Pump & Pipe Line was executed for Achhruram
Memorial College, Jhalda from Purulia Zilla Parishad in the year 2023, The details of the
Drinking Water Supply Schemes are as follows:

Date of Commencement: 07/06/2023
Date of Completion: 04/09/2023

Awarded Cost: 6,16,550/-

Executed by: District Engineer, Purulia,Zilla Parishad

| Therefore, | humbly request you to issue a duplicate certificate for the above-mentioned sinking
of Deep Tube Well with Solar Pump & Pipe Line by mentioning the Fund a]located in favor of
Achhruram Memorial College, Jhalda.

Please do the needful at the earliest.

Thanking You

Principal

Achhruram Memorial College

PRIHUF’AL Ol
1u1E{\nOr\lP- :
WE!:T BENGM

Website: www.amcollege.ac.in Mobile No: 7001631211

me@gmail.com



